
 
 

Winter 2022/2023 Events & Activities in Snowmass Village, CO 
Game of Stones, Music on the Mall, Snowmass Luminescence, Snowmass S’mores, 

and More Return to the Village this Winter 
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Snowmass Village, Colo., (November 23, 2022) – An iconic winter destination, 
Snowmass Village, CO offers a variety of seasonal events and activities for guests and 
locals to experience and enjoy. These include the ever-popular Snowmass S’mores; 
local favorite Game of Stones curling series; Snowmass Luminescence, Mardi Gras 
Celebrations; World Cup skiing; and much more. 
 
In addition, The Collective Snowmass, the hub for community activity in Snowmass Base 
Village, features a robust winter lineup. Programming includes the Snowmass Live 
Comedy & Music Series, Community Bingo, Chess Club, ACES Wild Perspective series, 
Live Storytelling with Alya Howe, the return of the Winter Holiday Market & Santa during 
the holiday season, open mic nights, salsa dancing, Discos on the Rink, karaoke, and 
more. The Collective also features a free ice-skating rink with free skate rentals and 
scheduled special performances. The rink is open daily to the public from 1:00 p.m. – 
9:00 p.m., pending weather conditions. Game of Stones, the highly successful curling 
series, returns to The Rink on Thursdays, mid-December through the end of February. 
This winter visit the Game Lounge & Selfie Den. For events, hours, and offerings, visit 
www.TheCollectiveSnowmass.com. 
 
“While skiing and snowboarding are what we are known for, the variety of fun 
alternatives off the slopes really take the Snowmass winter experience to the next level,” 
says Rose Abello, Tourism Director, Snowmass Tourism. “With amazing early season 
snow, experiences like Snowmass S’mores and Music on the Mall, and the return of 
World Cup ski racing to the Valley, Winter 2022/2023 is sure to be amazing.” 

https://nam02.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=http%3A%2F%2Fwww.thecollectivesnowmass.com%2F&data=05%7C01%7Cssanders%40eastwest.com%7Cc68f95276b78427dfe7908daa6e699e3%7C9c72f423d2774df68e67a8069954bd38%7C0%7C0%7C638005806606980037%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C3000%7C%7C%7C&sdata=G1L9g8HgXGpCvbpBG38AstttQQZz3buHWiaFYwrx3bc%3D&reserved=0
https://nam02.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=http%3A%2F%2Fwww.thecollectivesnowmass.com%2F&data=05%7C01%7Cssanders%40eastwest.com%7Cc68f95276b78427dfe7908daa6e699e3%7C9c72f423d2774df68e67a8069954bd38%7C0%7C0%7C638005806606980037%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C3000%7C%7C%7C&sdata=G1L9g8HgXGpCvbpBG38AstttQQZz3buHWiaFYwrx3bc%3D&reserved=0


 
Winter 2022/2023 Winter Activities  
Snowmass S’mores: Starting on opening day of ski season (November 19), guests of 
all ages can enjoy Snowmass S’mores, free starting at 3:30 p.m. daily throughout the 
winter season, presented by Snowmass Tourism. Guests can find branded s’mores carts 
(which resemble oversized marshmallows) in Snowmass Base Village and on the 
Snowmass Mall, featuring delicious s’mores treats. 
www.gosnowmass.com/activity/snowmass-smores/  
 
Snowmass Luminescence: When the lifts close at Snowmass, things really light up. 
Snowmass Luminescence, an interactive art and light display presented by Snowmass 
Tourism and Aspen Snowmass, immerses guests and community members in a 
dazzling world of light and art, located between Snowmass Base Village and the 
Snowmass Mall. This winter season features four installations, including the popular 
Electric Dandelions and Arches Tunnel, with new displays the Transporter and Evolution 
Field making their debut. Snowmass Luminescence begins December 18, 2022, from 
sunset to 9:00 p.m. daily. Light up the evening! www.gosnowmass.com/events 
 
Music on the Mall: Every Friday, starting November 25, 2022, through April 14, 2023, 
Music on Mall returns to Snowmass, featuring live music on the Tower Stage during 
après. Music on the Mall runs from 2:30 p.m. - 4:30 p.m. in November, December, 
January, and February and moves to 3:00 p.m. - 5:00 p.m. in March and April. 
Performances feature local Roaring Fork Valley musicians. 
www.gosnowmass.com/events 
 
Snowmass Mountain Mission: The Snowmass Mountain Mission is an app based, 
village-wide scavenger hunt designed to challenge creativity, test Snowmass knowledge, 
and enhance selfie skills. Download the Eventzee app from the App Store, enter an 
email, username and password, and the event code: Snowmass. 
www.gosnowmass.com/snowmass-mountain-mission 
 
Bud Light Game of Stones: Curling returns to Snowmass with the ever popular Game 
of Stones curling series on The Rink in Snowmass Base Village. Running (most) 
Thursdays starting December 22 through the end of February, teams of two compete in 
a head to head elimination competition. The first team to reach 10 points wins! Game of 
Stones takes place from 3:00 p.m. – 5:00 p.m.; register on site. Weather dependent. 
www.gosnowmass.com/events 
 
Ullr Nights: In honor of the Norse God of Snow, Ullr, Ullr Nights return to Snowmass 
this winter season. Take an evening gondola ride up the Elk Camp Gondola to the Elk 
Camp Restaurant for winter themed fun, including tubing, rides on the Breathtaker 
Alpine Coaster, snowbiking, a bonfire, s’mores, and hot cocoa. Enjoy an à la carte 
culinary celebration from 5:30 p.m. to 7:30 p.m. Winter 2022/2023 Ullr Night Dates - 
December 28, December 30, February 17, February 24, March 17, March 24; Tickets: 
$67 Activities Pass or $12 Ullr Night Admission. 
www.aspensnowmass.com/visit/activities/winter/ullr-nights  
 
Winter 2022/2023 Winter Events  
Mardi Gras, February 21, 2023: Over 40 years of Mardi Gras tradition returns to 
Snowmass Village on Fat Tuesday, February 21, 2023. Festivities include a Bud Light 

http://www.gosnowmass.com/activity/snowmass-smores/
http://www.gosnowmass.com/
http://www.gosnowmass.com/events
http://www.gosnowmass.com/snowmass-mountain-mission
http://www.gosnowmass.com/events
http://www.aspensnowmass.com/visit/activities/winter/ullr-nights


Hi-Fi Concert and a Bead Toss featuring the 2023 Mardi Gras King & Queen. 
www.gosnowmass.com/events 
 
Audi FIS Ski World Cup, March 3-5, 2023: Aspen Snowmass welcomes the return of 
international ski racing this season with the Audi FIS Ski World Cup, scheduled for 
March 3-5, 2023. The top men in the in the world compete on the America’s Downhill 
course on Aspen Mountain, an iconic World Cup venue with decades of racing history, 
with two downhills and a super G scheduled March 3-5, 2023. Aspen Snowmass hosted 
the first World Championships held outside of Europe in 1950 and the mountain has 
hosted innumerable ski racing legends since that time. Aspen Snowmass has hosted 
more than 100 World Cup races for both men and women over the years and was home 
to the World Cup Finals in 2017. For details and schedules, please visit 
www.aspensnowmass.com/visit/events/aspen-world-cup  
 
For more information, please visit www.gosnowmass.com. For winter photos of 
Snowmass Village, click here. Please credit the photographer listed in the file name as 
opposed to Snowmass Tourism. For additional winter events, please visit 
www.aspensnowmass.com.  
 
About Snowmass Village, Colorado – A renowned winter playground and vibrant 
summer community just 9 miles from Aspen, Snowmass consistently ranks as one of the 
best winter ski areas and summer mountain biking destinations in the world. Snowmass, 
along with the rest of the Roaring Fork Valley, is the first IMBA (International Mountain 
Biking Association) Gold-Level Ride Center™ in Colorado, only the 5th in United States, 
and the 7th in the world. Snowmass offers guests incredible views of mountain vistas, in 
addition to 2.8 million adjacent acres of wilderness, open for activities and exploration. 
Snowmass is home to 30+ restaurants, 95 percent slopeside lodging, shopping, unique 
special events and music – all year round. For more information and a complete 
calendar of events and activities, please visit www.gosnowmass.com. 
 
Snowmass Tourism Media Contact: Sara Stookey Sanchez, Public Relations Manager, 
Snowmass Tourism, 970-922-2285 or sstookey@gosnowmass.com.  
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